
From: "vance atkinson" <nostromo56@tx.rr.com>
To: "David Orr" <canardfinder@att.net>

Date: 11/4/2013 5:10:37 AM
Subject: Re: Greetings Vance

No... I had some problems with it a few years ago and took it down.  I now send out a page like this to those who request it.

vance

mailto:%22vance%20atkinson%22%20%3Cnostromo56@tx.rr.com%3E
mailto:canardfinder@att.net


On 11/3/2013 10:24 PM, David Orr wrote:

Kits and assemble,d prices; 

Kit Prices (paid Assembled Prices (paid 1 

Includes postage Includes postage 

t. Smalt .. -..... . .$60.00 t . s.ma:11 .. -~ · ... .$165.00 
2,. Medium., .. .... ,$701

•
100 2. Medaum~ .. .. $170 .. 00 

a. Large ..... , .. , .. ,. . $75 .. 00 3.. llarge .......... .$180,.00 

tntema·lty Lighted 
1 . Sm·alt ...... .. .... $90,.00 
2. Medium ......• $'100.00 
3. Large ... .... ... H$1105 .. 00 

fntsmalty Li.Qhted 
1 Sm.al ,.., . ... .. . . $1195.,00 
2. IM1edium ...... $200~00 
3. Large ......... ,. $210 .. 00 

For shipping intem,attonal, add $15. 00 

man not letup· rer Olredlt.,cardl. You can :tend me e dleck«DO P,ayPaJ. 

II' PayPal! UN lnoa1RJmo68. 

H'sendng a~ tend ltto; 
Vance ldldneoo 
3&04. Wllomet ct. 
EMdfOrd Tx. 76021 

Yiou aa111 also call me al: ,817-3M-8064 · home. 
Or cell! phone at a17~29EH940. 
Ema11.. n01tn111no580btrr.com 

Gauoe wilh aufo. ·fuel 
wlh 10% Ethanol 

LEDs 



Is your website up? 

I was trying to open it and it said the page cannot be displayed. 

Beagle 


